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No doctrine in Scripture wears a more amiable and inviting aspect 
to the self-condemned, than that of the Divine Sovereignty, as 
described by Paul, in his Epistle to the Romans, especially, chap. 
ix. This removes every cause of despair to the most wretched of 
mankind. For who can be led to despair by the view of any 
deficiency about himself whatever, who knows that none but the 
utterly deficient are chosen of God to salvation? As no doctrine is 

more encouraging than this to the miserable, so none is more 
provoking to the sons of pride, who want to stand upon their 
distinctions before God, and are not yet reduced so low as to be 
entirely at mercy for their salvation. Though this doctrine is not 
yet erased out of the standards of either of our national churches, 
yet it is generally opposed, and held in great contempt both by 
clergy and laity, as well as by the Dissenters. Many declaimers 
about the Divine Benevolence, with open mouth, show their spite 
against the Divine goodness preached by Paul. Many zealous 
disputers against Deists and Infidels, with great arrogance 

renounce the Sovereign of the Universe. And if we observe the 
artifices of the popular preachers, we shall find them likewise 
denying that “the Lord God omnipotent reigneth.” Yet this hated 
article of the Sovereignty of the Divine choice, will ever be held 
most sacred by all who love the Ancient Gospel. To them it is 
highly acceptable, because they know that there was no occasion 
for such Sovereignty to appear, but that grace might be shown to 
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the worthless. They know that otherwise all mankind, without 

distinction, had perished according to every rule of equity. The 
popular preachers are greatly disgusted at this doctrine, because, 
according to their own style, "here is no visible ground for faith to 
rest upon." Here no man's pride is flattered; no man can find any 
ground to presume that the Deity regards him more than others. 
Therefore, while they are busy in stimulating their hearers to the 
exercise of faith, they are at great pains to keep this doctrine as 
far removed from their thoughts as possible. But when once the 
hearers, by their assistance, have prepared some ground for faith 
to rest upon, then they are freely allowed to solace themselves 

with the doctrine of election, because they have now acquired 
some reason why God in his choice should respect them more 
than others. - The consequence of this change in the Arminian 
controversy, from that way wherein Gomarus {Franciscus 
Gomarus, 1563 – 1641, Dutch theologian, a strict Calvinist and 
opponent of the teaching of Jacobus Arminius, which was formally 
judged at the Synod of Dort in 1619} held it was a great 
alteration in the strain of preaching amongst the most zealous 
Calvinists. For in place of free justification by God's grace, 
through the redemption that is in Christ's blood, much insisted on 

by the Reformers against the Roman Church, even as it had been 
before by the Apostles against the Jews and Judaizing Christians, 
laboring more in setting forth the revealed righteousness to be 
believed against everything opposed to it, than in any 
descriptions of the exercise of the mind and heart in believing; 
they now began to insist much more in their sermons on free 
electing grace, but especially on the efficacious power of that 
Grace in the conversion of the elect, working unfeigned faith in 
them, and turning them to God in a sincere repentance; and then 
this took the place of the answer of a good conscience toward 
God by Christ’s resurrection, {justified by his resurrection; not as 
the matter, or cause, of the remission of our sins in the sight of 
God; but as a full demonstrative evidence, that his life was an 
adequate ransom; and that “the Lord is well pleased for his 
righteousness sake;” a manifest declaration, or irrefutable proof 
that the work was finished, and that the Son by his “one offering 
had perfected forever them that are sanctified,”} as the spring of 
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Christian religion. This was attended with large descriptions, how 

a man should find himself under the operation of that free and 
efficacious grace, calling him effectually, regenerating, and 
converting him to receive Christ by a true faith, and to 
repentance unto life; while the things set forth in these 
descriptions were often not things accompanying salvation. The 
effect of this strain of doctrine, upon them that hearkened to it, 
was, their seeking peace with God, and rest to their consciences, 
by what they might feel in themselves, the motions of their 
hearts, and the exercises of their souls, in compliance with the 
call to faith and repentance, under that efficacious operation of 

grace, which they hoped to find in using those means, whereby 
they supposed it to be conveyed; or if they could persuade 
themselves that they had found it, then they looked on 
themselves as already converted, and in a state of favor with 
God; comforting themselves against the fears of losing the Divine 
Favor again, by the inamissibility of grace, or the perseverance of 
the saints. But, however different this be from the doctrine of the 
Arminians, concerning electing and converting grace and 
perseverance; yet it comes to the very same thing with him at 
last, as to the grand point of the justification of a sinner before 

God. For whether the Pharisee in the parable, opposing himself to 
the Publican, as more fit for acceptance, did thank God in whole, 
or in part, for what he was in distinction from him and other 
sinners; yet his confidence in coming before him for acceptance, 
was in what he found himself to be, and in what he did, by the 
efficacious operation of God’s special grace, working all in him 
irresistibly. How opposite to this is the Publican’s way of coming 
before God, finding nothing about himself but what makes him 
the object of Divine Abhorrence, and having no better thing to 
say of himself, than that he is a sinner, and so a meet object for 
Divine mercy and grace, justifying freely through the Propitiation 
for sin, set forth to declare the Divine Justice in justifying the 
ungodly? He has no other ground of confidence but that, in 
appearing before God, nor anything else to encourage him to 
hope for his favor and acceptance with him. And so his address to 
God is in these words, “God be propitious to me a sinner.” Now, 
he went down to his house justified rather than the other! - 
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Hence it is, that in leading their hearers to faith, they constantly 

instruct them how to qualify themselves, so as they may be in a 
condition to advance some claim upon the Deity, and treat with 
him on some rule of equity; or so as they may find some reason 
why he should regard them more than others, and, accordingly, 
grant the favors they desire of him. They maintain, indeed, that 
men can obtain no benefit from the Deity but in the way of grace; 
yet, it is evident, that grace obtained in the way they direct is 
improperly so called, at least it is very different from the apostolic 
notion of Divine Grace. Paul, when speaking of the Sovereignty of 
the Divine choice of men to salvation, as proceeding upon grace, 

in opposition to every notion of desert in those who are chosen, 
distinguishes that grace in the following manner, “And if by grace, 
then is it no more of works; otherwise grace is no more grace; 
but if it be of works, then is it no more grace; otherwise work is 
no work.” If this one text were well understood, the whole body 
of the popular doctrine would fall to the ground at once. Here we 
see how different the Divine choice is from that of men, who 
choose what is best and reject what is worst. God in blessing 
men, or choosing them to blessedness, has no regard to any 
distinction among them. All the objects of his favor are such as 

deserved equally to be rejected. According to the Apostle's 
reasoning, when God blesses any man with grace, he has no 
regard to any work, requisite, or motion of his will, by which he 
excels another; for if he had, then the grace thus said to be 
bestowed would be no more grace, but rather the respect due to 
worth, or the reward belonging to the work. - “Much more then 
being now justified by His blood, we shall he saved from wrath 
through him.” Whatever doctrine then teaches us to think, that 
our friendly correspondence or acceptance with God is begun by 
our own good endeavors, seconded by the Divine aid, or even 
first prompted by the Divine influence, leads us to look for 
acceptance with God by our own righteousness; for whatever I 
do, however assisted or prompted, is still my own work; 
otherwise the most common actions of life could not be called our 
own, seeing in all these we must still acknowledge our 
dependence on God, “in whom we live, move, and have our 
being.” Agreeably to what is now said, we may find Philosophers 
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and Pharisees, both ancient and modern, in the height of their 

self-applause, acknowledging Divine assistance, and ready to 
agree in using language like this, “God, I thank thee for my 
excellency above other men.” We must begin our religion then as 
we would end it. Our acceptance with God, first and last, must 
rest entirely on the work finished by Jesus Christ on the cross; or 
we must betake ourselves to what many call the religion of 
nature, and what God warrants us to call the religion of pride, as 
being no less opposite to the law of nature, than to the Gospel.  

 
 


